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Solve each problem.
1) Isabel had to complete nine pages of homework. Each page had four problems on it. How

many problems did she have to complete total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

2) Debby was making necklaces for her friends. She had nine friends who wanted a necklace
and each necklace took seven beads. How many bead would she need total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

3) Sam was packing up his old toys. He managed to squeeze eight toys into a box. If Sam
filled up nine boxes, how many toys did he pack total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

4) A furniture store was selling new chairs for seven dollars each. If a company bought three
chairs, how much money would they end up spending?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

5) Vanessa bought four music albums online. If each album had five songs, how many songs
did she buy total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

6) An airline lets each passenger take nine pieces of luggage. If there were seven people
flying, how many bags could they take total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

7) A teacher had three students in her classes. If each student completed nine problems how
many problems would she have to grade?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

8) The soda machine in the lobby of a hotel cost seven quarters for each can. How many
quarters would you need for six sodas?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

9) A pet store had four cages of snakes with four snakes in each cage. How many snakes did
the pet store have total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

10) On her MP3 player, Rachel had three different singers with five songs from each singer.
How many songs did Rachel have total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

11) A chef can cook three meals in a minute. How many meals could he cook in four minutes?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

12) Haley was placing her spare change into stacks. Each stack had seven coins. If she had
four stacks, how many coins did she have?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

Answers

1. 36

2. 63

3. 72

4. 21

5. 20

6. 63

7. 27

8. 42

9. 16

10. 15

11. 12

12. 28

1-10 92 83 75 67 58 50 42 33 25 17
11-12 8 0
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Solve each problem.
1) Isabel had to complete nine pages of homework. Each page had four problems on it. How

many problems did she have to complete total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

2) Debby was making necklaces for her friends. She had nine friends who wanted a necklace
and each necklace took seven beads. How many bead would she need total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

3) Sam was packing up his old toys. He managed to squeeze eight toys into a box. If Sam
filled up nine boxes, how many toys did he pack total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

4) A furniture store was selling new chairs for seven dollars each. If a company bought three
chairs, how much money would they end up spending?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

5) Vanessa bought four music albums online. If each album had five songs, how many songs
did she buy total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

6) An airline lets each passenger take nine pieces of luggage. If there were seven people
flying, how many bags could they take total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

7) A teacher had three students in her classes. If each student completed nine problems how
many problems would she have to grade?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

8) The soda machine in the lobby of a hotel cost seven quarters for each can. How many
quarters would you need for six sodas?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

9) A pet store had four cages of snakes with four snakes in each cage. How many snakes did
the pet store have total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

10) On her MP3 player, Rachel had three different singers with five songs from each singer.
How many songs did Rachel have total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

11) A chef can cook three meals in a minute. How many meals could he cook in four minutes?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

12) Haley was placing her spare change into stacks. Each stack had seven coins. If she had
four stacks, how many coins did she have?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

Answers

1. 36

2. 63

3. 72

4. 21

5. 20

6. 63

7. 27

8. 42

9. 16

10. 15

11. 12

12. 28

1-10 92 83 75 67 58 50 42 33 25 17
11-12 8 0



Name:Multiplication within 100

Math www.CommonCoreSheets.com

Solve each problem.

63 27 20 15 42

36 21 16 63 72

1) Isabel had to complete 9 pages of homework. Each page had 4 problems on it. How many
problems did she have to complete total?

2) Debby was making necklaces for her friends. She had 9 friends who wanted a necklace and
each necklace took 7 beads. How many bead would she need total?

3) Sam was packing up his old toys. He managed to squeeze 8 toys into a box. If Sam filled
up 9 boxes, how many toys did he pack total?

4) A furniture store was selling new chairs for 7 dollars each. If a company bought 3 chairs,
how much money would they end up spending?

5) Vanessa bought 4 music albums online. If each album had 5 songs, how many songs did
she buy total?

6) An airline lets each passenger take 9 pieces of luggage. If there were 7 people flying, how
many bags could they take total?

7) A teacher had 3 students in her classes. If each student completed 9 problems how many
problems would she have to grade?

8) The soda machine in the lobby of a hotel cost 7 quarters for each can. How many quarters
would you need for 6 sodas?

9) A pet store had 4 cages of snakes with 4 snakes in each cage. How many snakes did the pet
store have total?

10) On her MP3 player, Rachel had 3 different singers with 5 songs from each singer. How
many songs did Rachel have total?

Answers

1. 36

2. 63

3. 72

4. 21

5. 20

6. 63

7. 27

8. 42

9. 16

10. 15

Modified 1-10 90 80 70 60 50 40 30 20 10 0
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