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Solve each problem.
1) At the carnival there are six students selling tickets. If each student sells five tickets, how

many tickets would be sold all together?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

2) The soda machine in the lobby of a hotel cost seven quarters for each can. How many
quarters would you need for nine sodas?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

3) For his birthday Edward brought three boxes of cupcakes to school. If each box had six
cupcakes in it, how many cupcakes did he have total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

4) Cody was unpacking boxes of toys. If he has five boxes with nine toys in each box, how
many toys does he have all together?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

5) A delivery driver had to make eight more stops on his route. At each stop he had to drop
off eight boxes. How many boxes does he have?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

6) An architect was building a hotel downtown. He built it four stories tall with eight rooms
on each story. How many rooms does the hotel have total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

7) George's mother had eight photo albums with five pictures in each album. How many
pictures did his mother have total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

8) A pet store had six cages of snakes with seven snakes in each cage. How many snakes did
the pet store have total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

9) Sam could fit nine action figures on each shelf in his room. His room has three shelves.
How many action figures total could his shelves hold?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

10) A toy store sold eight board games in one day. If each game cost seven dollars, how much
money did they make?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

11) Adam was placing his spare change into stacks. Each stack had four coins. If he had six
stacks, how many coins did he have all together?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

12) An airline lets each passenger take two pieces of luggage. If there were seven people
flying, how many bags could they take total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

Answers

1. 30

2. 63

3. 18

4. 45

5. 64

6. 32

7. 40

8. 42

9. 27

10. 56

11. 24

12. 14

1-10 92 83 75 67 58 50 42 33 25 17
11-12 8 0
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Solve each problem.
1) At the carnival there are six students selling tickets. If each student sells five tickets, how

many tickets would be sold all together?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

2) The soda machine in the lobby of a hotel cost seven quarters for each can. How many
quarters would you need for nine sodas?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

3) For his birthday Edward brought three boxes of cupcakes to school. If each box had six
cupcakes in it, how many cupcakes did he have total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

4) Cody was unpacking boxes of toys. If he has five boxes with nine toys in each box, how
many toys does he have all together?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

5) A delivery driver had to make eight more stops on his route. At each stop he had to drop
off eight boxes. How many boxes does he have?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

6) An architect was building a hotel downtown. He built it four stories tall with eight rooms
on each story. How many rooms does the hotel have total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

7) George's mother had eight photo albums with five pictures in each album. How many
pictures did his mother have total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

8) A pet store had six cages of snakes with seven snakes in each cage. How many snakes did
the pet store have total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

9) Sam could fit nine action figures on each shelf in his room. His room has three shelves.
How many action figures total could his shelves hold?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

10) A toy store sold eight board games in one day. If each game cost seven dollars, how much
money did they make?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

11) Adam was placing his spare change into stacks. Each stack had four coins. If he had six
stacks, how many coins did he have all together?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

12) An airline lets each passenger take two pieces of luggage. If there were seven people
flying, how many bags could they take total?

Equal Groups - (Unknown Product)

Answers

1. 30

2. 63

3. 18

4. 45

5. 64

6. 32

7. 40

8. 42

9. 27

10. 56

11. 24

12. 14

1-10 92 83 75 67 58 50 42 33 25 17
11-12 8 0
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Solve each problem.

64 30 18 63 40

42 45 56 27 32

1) At the carnival there are 6 students selling tickets. If each student sells 5 tickets, how many
tickets would be sold all together?

2) The soda machine in the lobby of a hotel cost 7 quarters for each can. How many quarters
would you need for 9 sodas?

3) For his birthday Edward brought 3 boxes of cupcakes to school. If each box had 6
cupcakes in it, how many cupcakes did he have total?

4) Cody was unpacking boxes of toys. If he has 5 boxes with 9 toys in each box, how many
toys does he have all together?

5) A delivery driver had to make 8 more stops on his route. At each stop he had to drop off 8
boxes. How many boxes does he have?

6) An architect was building a hotel downtown. He built it 4 stories tall with 8 rooms on each
story. How many rooms does the hotel have total?

7) George's mother had 8 photo albums with 5 pictures in each album. How many pictures did
his mother have total?

8) A pet store had 6 cages of snakes with 7 snakes in each cage. How many snakes did the pet
store have total?

9) Sam could fit 9 action figures on each shelf in his room. His room has 3 shelves. How
many action figures total could his shelves hold?

10) A toy store sold 8 board games in one day. If each game cost 7 dollars, how much money
did they make?

Answers

1. 30

2. 63

3. 18

4. 45

5. 64

6. 32

7. 40

8. 42

9. 27

10. 56

Modified 1-10 90 80 70 60 50 40 30 20 10 0
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